EXHIBITF

RECEIVED

AUG 217 2013

BUREAU OF
LEGISLATIVE RESEARCH



brownb
Typewritten Text
EXHIBIT F

brownb
Typewritten Text

brownb
Typewritten Text

brownb
Typewritten Text

brownb
Typewritten Text

brownb
Typewritten Text


ARKANSAS ENERGY CODE FOR-NEW-
AND-AMENDMENTS

CONTENTS

a.\.-......-.-.....,.nn‘-.......-..--..-.......-....---........---......----.-.

INTRODLICTION.
NI TR

ONVERVTENL
YIS Y

........................-.............................‘-..........................

dn H W

QITMANARY
=) A~

Ty o T ..................‘............-.......,...........................................

ant
s § =7 ¥ 1 =aserre-r e eI

5
3

Pt Vol

o rerrrrrrrr Ay

3
[ ;eﬂst«nn{-:n“ nata 12219019 14
CHOR PO o =vr= T T T T T T T s e Tt e a s errear e ee e LT

oL JY-Y.]
TS Yy PootTos TR LR EE L

Annraach 14
T

lxl.lt.uuuvu-........u-...-.....u--‘n......-.--.....--.........-.-......-A..-.....--...

Fadal
;115.)..................................................................,...........











































A
kS
®
& "
i\ g &
& % Q
[ o B
S % 2
Aw_ kS i
M. wh .mw
] e ah
@) D S
2 D 1]
[ f o
£ Fi )
[= 1 ] —
Z, @) =
o) 3 &
i Rt &
.nw_ &) an
m“w._ e <
ol
. & i
i ) X
! i
L mw of
c 4 %
g 2! T 5
oL 2 %) i ﬂw
) & =1
ﬁu i [03] A
. g o
wh O <
of o =
NS & =]
4 & &
% 5 e
& 1 * p?
2 . § i
) ’ w
® x D
oh Hp - 2
A & . h
ko 4 5
i ©
ﬂv ﬁU et
ok = s







Raf 26
FaZ iz g

18




/}ARKANSAS

Economic Development Commission

- ENERGY OFFICE

Arkansas Economic Development Commission — Energy Office
900 West Capitol Avenue
Little Rock, Arkansas 72113
501-682-6103
www.arkansasenergy.org




Contents

Introduction.....co e errerssnnner renreererians o ereereeans oresnennrnr rerenreranees veanesrassnnen T S varsssrervans rreresarans crenned

OVEIVIEW .o rievemrserrresinninisenens eereeerrenees prareeessenes rveustoeerasasereravesenrmretaIneasiaes rreen

Arkansas Amendments. ..., preerennnay reeirererrerine T

Chapter 1: Administration.......... veverreenns eererireenne rerererene

Chapter 2: Definitions........ veererreries ferrerbeesaree st et as T nes
Chapter 3. Climate Zones ......ccccenee ereeeanaes verererenne
Chapter 4: Residential Energy Efficiency .............
Chapter 5: Commercial Energy Efficiency ... .
Chapter 6: Referenced Standards......weenccisinsinnens

Appendices............ Verermtea remeeeensen oo A e
APPENDIX A: SAMPLE ORDINANCE........

APPENDIX B: AIR SEALING K POINTS....... .......

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

............ verrenrsnnieenes 14

.................. rererrenenserssrssansnsnes 1D

.............. rrevsrrareeenssrianeerensesaiinss 1O

......................... veverereererern 17
Page 2 of 29



Introduction

The Arkansas General Assembly authorized the Arkansas Energy Office to promulgate these regulations in Section 3{B}2}c)
of Act 7 of 1981. These rules and reguiations are in adherence with the Administrative Procedures Act. The 2013 Arkansas
Energy Code for New Building Construction establishes minimum energy requirements for residential and commercial
buildings in the State of Arkansas.

Residential and Commercial

For residential and commercial structures, Arkansas adopts the International En ergy Conservation Code {IECC), 2008

'in effect on 1/1/2014.

Edition, published and copyrighted by the International Codes Council which wi

To order copies of the International Energy Conservation Code 2009 Editic

International Code Council

900 Montclair Road

Birmingham, Alabama 35213-1206

Phone: 1-800-786-4452, Fax: 205-591-0775 ,
Telecommunications Device for the Deaf: 205-599
Copyright © 1996-1998 Southern Building Code Co
Web: www.iccsafe.org

Commercial

Chapter 5 of the IECC 2009 allows for an alterna e ‘ mmercial structures through the American
Society of Heating, Refrigerating, and Air Conditioning '
Energy Standard for Buildings Exce

bundied edition from the Internatic

90.1-2007 contact:

American Society of Heating, Refrige
1791 TullieCircle, N.E. "

Questions, inquill;leas':-'@_r,‘{equest for copi

_E:_f the 2013-Ar:kansas Energy Code for New Building Construction Supplements and
Amendments may be addressed to: ;

Arkansas Energy Ofﬁce :
Attn: 2013 Arkansas Energy Code for New Building Construction
900 West Capitol Avenue -
Little Rock, Arkansas 72201

Phone: 800-558-2633 or 501-682-6103, Fax;: 501-682-7499

Email: Energyinfo@ArkansasEDC.com

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments ) Page 3 of 29



Qverview

The INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 2009 Edition (IECC 2009), published by the International
Code Council, when used in conjunction with these State of Arkansas Supplements and these Amendments to
the Arkansas Energy Code for New Building Construction shall constitute the 2013 Arkansas Energy Code. In
cases where there are differences between these “Supplements and Amendments” and the IECC 2009 Edition,
these “Supplements and Amendments” shall take precedence.

Each of the following Chapters of this document associates directly with the corresponding chapters of the IECC
2009 unless otherwise noted.

‘ igration in a building. Proper sealing
1ewalls, ceiling and foundation is as
and component U-factors.

Air infiltration accounts for substantial heat loss, heat gain and
around ali doors, windows and other envelope penetrations thy

It is not the intention of this Code to abridge safety o
Supplements and Amendments conflict with other man
Supplements and Amendments shall be enforced as writt
requirements of other mandatory State Minimum Standard

relieving the ed builder or contractor of his or her

and regulatio

These minimum standards shall not be con
responsibility for compliance with local ordinanc

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction supplements and Amendments Page 4 of 29



Arkansas Amendments

*Revise the International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, as follows:

Chapter 1: Administration

CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 101.1 %]
SCOPE AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

*Delete ‘Title’ and replace with the following:

102.1 Title. This Code shall be known as the 2013 Arkansa Energy Code for New Bwld Construction and shall

be cited as such. it is referred to herein as “this Code” or “the Arkansas: Energy Code.”

101.5.1 Compliance materials. At minimum;.
Report which includes an Arkansas Home Per

d to approve specn‘lc computer software such as
ilar materials that meet the intent of this Code.

*Add 101.6 ‘Builder responsibility’ as follows:

101.6 Builder responmbuhty ‘Compllance signifies that the licensed building or contractor has constructed or
will construct or renovate the bunldlng in compliance with the requirements of this Code, and that by inspection
within a two-year period from the date of completion, If the building fails to meet the Code’s specifications,
understands that he or she is responsible for bringing the building into compliance with this Code.

2013 Arkan§as Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 5 of 29



*Add 101.7 ‘Certified rater approved list’

101.8 Certified rater approved list. In order to be eligible to conduct envelope/duct testing and provide a Home
Energy Rating Systems (HERS) Report an eligible rater must submit the following to the Arkansas Energy Office
on an annual basis by February 1* of each year beginning in 2014:

1. Copy of RESNET certification credentials which includes:
a. RESNET Certification
b. RESNET Identification Number
c. Expiration date of certification
d. Name of HERS provider
Contact information
Number of year’s rater has conducted ratings
Number of ratings from the previous year
Proof of insurance and liability coverage reqt

RN

v RESNET and the Stat

Arkansas

The Arkansas Energy Office shall make this list of raters, 4.other information, availableifo.the public. This list
shall be posted at www.arkansasenergy.org and hard copie *’ be vailable upon‘re,‘ est. This fist is not
an endorsement of any particular rater o station of his or | > ity of work. Itis for informational
purposes for the general public. :

If an inspection within a two-year period from
Code’s specifications, the casé can‘be submitted tg

ate d@cﬁ’mentation from each of the

fig the prew‘o(jic; year, may apply to on the list after

FC INSTRUCTION, DESIGN OR INSULATING SYSTEMS
10N AND ENFORCEMENT

cifications comply with the provisions of this Code in a manner
¥ Arkansas State law (see also the current version of the Arkansas Fire
ume 1 Building).

buildings shall ensure the
consistent with their obliga
prevention Code, Volume | Fire

SECTION 104
INSPECTIONS

*Revise Section 104 ‘Inspections’ as follows:

104.1 General. Construction or work that must comply with this Code sh_all be subject to inspection by the
Arkansas Energy Office or its agent, or by the code official.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 6 0f 29



104.2 Final inspection. Code officials within a county or municipality who have adopted this Code and conduct
final inspections as a part of their normal operations shall perform a final inspection and approval for buildings
when completed and ready for occupancy.

104.3 Re-inspection. The Arkansas Energy Office or its agent or code official may cause a structure to be re-
inspected.

SECTION 110
ENFORCEMENT

*Add Section 110 ‘Enforcement and Adoption’ as follows:

110.1 General. Enforcement of this Code shall be the respon ibi |ty"’of theA 'Ega,nsas Energy Office or focal
government, R

110.2 Local Government. All counties, cities or muni ipalities that issue building pe its for new building
construction are required to adopt this Code for new cbng;n’gug_tion, additions and ren'clivéfi_qr_\ of existing
structures. However, the local municipality shall not in ahff\'{qﬁiy:qu‘ ‘:tf;'e energy conséﬁaft_‘io_n standards in
this Code or promulgate or adopt rules orregulations that are I sstrmgent than this Code. -

A local government may exercise other admin{s;rétlvé;a‘n_d_‘enforceméqtfpfpcedures that it deems necessary to
affect the purposes of this Code, including, butnot limited to; prior plan approval, building permit requirements,
and inspections during the coui‘ﬁe of construction : BN

SECTION 111
Adoptie

*Add Secti n111‘Adopt|on’ as foll WS!

111.1 Adoptlon Arkansaéfdd,égﬁ _15-10-265(b)(3)(B) r.éql.r“;'r'és that any city or county in Arkansas which issues
building pé‘l‘r‘b}__ts‘ for new buildingﬂjc_gnstrucﬁé‘i‘f:(-_r_gferred to herein as “applicable cities or counties”) shall adopt

the Arkansas Energy Code as amended.

111.1.1 Date of adoption: App[ipable cities or counties shail adopt the Arkansas Energy Code prior to
12/31/2014.

111.1.2 Acknowledg‘éﬁi.e_j it.of Adoption. Upon adoption of the Arkansas Energy Code, applicable cities
or counties are required to submit a copy of the adoption ordinance to the Arkansas Energy Office. If
the applicable city or county has not adopted the Arkansas Energy Code by 12/31/2014 the mayor
and/or county judge is required to submit a letter to the Arkansas Energy Office, no later than 60 days
after this deadline, describing why the city or county is not in compliance with Arkansas Code § 15-10-
205(b)(3)(B).

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 7 of 29



SECTION 110
EFFECTIVE DATE

*Add Section 112 ‘Effective Date’ as follows:

112.1 Mandatory duct testing, envelope testing and performance labeling requirements are effective on
1/1/2015. The effective date for which all other requirements of this Code shall be met is 1/1/2016.

Chapter 2: Definitions

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

SECTION 202
GENERAL DEFINIT]

ATTIC KNEEWALL. Any vertical or near-vertical wall in
side and uncondttloned attic space on the other 5|de i

accurate by a certu‘:ed rater
shall include, i
Report, Hom

or other RESNET approved software. This report
> 2009 UA Compliance, IECC 2009 Performance

sible cooling of the supply air (directly or indirectly) which has been
previously heated above'th re to which the air is to be supplied to the conditioned space for proper

control of the temperature

RECOVERED ENERGY. Energy utilized which would otherwise be wasted {i.e., not contribute to a desired end
use} from an energy utilization system.

RESET. Adjustment of the set point of a control instrument to a higher or lower value automatically or manually
to conserve energy.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments ) Page 8 of 29



Chapter 3: Climate Zones

CHAPTER 3
CLIMATE ZONES

SECTION 301
CLIMATE ZONES

*Replace Figure 301.1 with the following:

Figure301.1 Arkansas Climate Zones

*Revise Table 301, to include on Arkansas-specific information as follows:

Sy _ TABLE 301.1
CLIMATE ZONES, MOISTURE REGINES, AND WARM-HUMID DESIGNATIONS BY STATE, COUNTY AND
~ TERRITORY

2

Climate Zone 4 contains counties of Baxter, Benton, Boone, Carroll, Fulton, izard, Madison, Marion, Newton, Search, Stone
and Washington.

Climate Zone 3 contains counties of Arkansas, Ashley, Bradley, Calhoun, Chicot, Clark, Clay, Cleburne, Cleveland, Columbia,
Conway, Craighead, Crawford, Crittenden, Dross, Dallas, Desha, Drew, Faulkner, Franklin, Garland, Grant, Greene,
Hempstead, Hot Spring, Howard, Independence, Jackson, lefferson, Johnson, Lafayette, Lawrence, Lee, Lincoln, Little River,
Logan, Lonoke, Miller, Mississippi, Monroe, Montgomery, Nevada, Quachita, Perry, Phillips, Pike, Poinsett, Polk, Pope,
Prairie, Pulaski, Randolph, Saline, Scott, Sebastian, Sevier, Sharp, St. Francis, Union, Van Buren, White, Woodruff and Yell.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplerments and Amendments Page 9 of 29



Chapter 4: Residential Energy Efficiency

CHAPTER 4
RESIDENTIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY

SECTION 401
GENERAL

*Revise Section 401.3 ‘Disclosure labels {Mandatory)’ as follows

ed annual energy costs of the

include the signature and contact information for the
this location until purchase of the home.

5
e electricatl distribution’panel. The
ry label, service disconnect label or other
iabel shall list the predominant R-

of heating, ¢ giing and service water heating
c furnace, or baseboard electric heater is installed in

decrease the stringency of the's rds reflected in this Code. The version number of the label must be clearly
stated in the bottom left corner of the label. This label must be made available by the Arkansas Energy Office to

the public on its website, through E-rnail and by other means.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Bullding Construction supplements and Amendments Page 10 of 29



*Add 401.4 ‘Home Energy Rating (Mandatory)’ as follows:

401.4 Home Energy Rating (Mandatory). All new construction projects shall receive a Home Energy Rating
(HERS}) Rating performed by a certified rater. This report shall be given to all potential buyers. This report shall
be provided to the appraiser to estimate the energy efficiency of the subject property and for potential
adjustments for energy efficiency. If requested, copies shall be provided to mortgage lenders, realtors and
others stakeholders involved with the transaction.

SECTION 402
BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOP

*Revise Table 402.1.1, ‘INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUEREMENTQBY COMPONENT™ as follows:

Delete ‘SLAB R-VALUE & DEPTH’ requirement for ‘CLIM_A

INE 4 except Marln'e_: and replace with ‘0.
*Delete Section 402.4.2 ‘Air sealing and insulation’
*Re-name and Revise Section 402.4.2.1, ‘Testing optior’, t"o‘_‘.;';_r;eezcl ae__fd[!oﬁvs:

402.4.2 Air sealing and insulation.

Building envelope tightness and insulation lnstallation shall be con5|dered acceptable when tested air leakage is
less than seven air changes per | hour (ACH) when tested With-\l"f‘ ) at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa).
Testing shall occur after rough m and after mstallatlon of pen" £ ; ns ofthe bu:ldlng envelope, including
penetrations for utllltles, plumbmg elect ical, and ventllat" nand combust:on appliances. Testing shall be
performed by a certified rater»

*Delete Section 402.4.2.2, ‘Vlsual msp'. ction,option’, and st 'bstitute the following:

402.4.2.2. Low-rlse multlfamlly testin .protocol. Where‘a resuient:a! building is classified as R-2, envelope
testing of less than 100 percent shalt be’ acceptabie if one of the following two testing protocols is applied.

1. Testlng Protocol 1A samplmg of one m‘four of all dwelling units on each floor within each multifamily
building shalI be tested for envelope tightness. If any dwelling unit within the building fails to meet the
performance testmg goal, the "ernamlng three shall be tested. If any of those fail to meet the goal, all on
the floor will be’ tested Any dwe[lmg unit that fails shall be further sealed and retested untif the unit
passes the performance testmg goal.

2. Testing Protocol 2: Use the' sampling protocol as described in Chapter 6 of the 2006 Mortgage Industry
National Home Energy Rating Systems Standards.

Exception: Building envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items
listed in Table 402.4.2 applicable to the method of construction, are field verified, for all dwelling units, by a
third party ICC Certified Residential Energy Inspector/Plans Examiner or equivalent qualifications as approved
by the code official.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 11 0f 29



SECTION 403
SYSTEMS
*Delete Section 403.1.1, ‘Programmable thermostat.’
*Revise Section 403.2.2, ‘Sealing {(Mandatory)’ exceptions, as follows:

403,2.2 Sealing {Mandatory):

..total leakage shall be less than or equal to 4 ¢fm (113.3 L/min) pel
area.

'_(;)_li‘:"ft2 (9.29 m?) of conditioned floor

Exceptions:

1. Duct tightness test is not required if the air hand

spuce.
2. Duct tightness testing is not required for existing duct systems unless more
modified.
3. |fthe air handler, furnace or evaporater coil is replaced xisting system, all joints, seams and

connections from equipment to dhg yste
sealing requirements of this Code and be \

nnections to plenums shall meet the

losure systeris. Without exception all closure systems shall have
. im) thick. Closure systems used with rigid fibrous glass ducts shall

marked 181 r pressure-sensitive tape used with mastic, 181A-M for only
heat-sensitive tape used with mastic. Closure systems used with flexible air ducts and
s:shall comply w ﬁ%ULlSlB and shall be marked 181B-FX for pressure sensitive tape used
with mastic or 181B-Mf yr.only mastic:-Buct connections to flanges of air distribution system equipment or
sheet metal fittings shall use masti be mechanically fastened. Mechanical fasteners for use with flexible
nonmetallic air ducts shall comply with UL 1818 at least 1-1/2 inches (38 mm) and shall use mastic and be
mechanically fastened by meansof at least three sheet-metal screws or rivets equally spaced around the joint.
Closure systems used to seal metal ductwork shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s
installation instructions.

Exceptions:

1. Application of spray polyurethane foam insulation and mastic shall be permitted without additional joint
seals.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 12 of 29



2. Where a duct connection is made that is partially inaccessible, three screws or rivets shall be equally
spaced on the exposed portion of the joint so as to prevent a hinge effect. Mastic must be applied on all
accessible sides.

3. Continuously welded or locking type longitudinal joints and seams in ducts operating at static pressures
less than 2 inches of water column (500Pa) pressure classification shall not require additional closure
systems.

*Delete Section 404.1, ‘Lighting equipment (Prescriptive)’

Chapter 5: Commercial Energy Efficiency

CHAPTER'S:
COMMERCIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY

*Replace mentions of the International Mechanical Cod with the Arkansas Mechanical Code in the following in
Sections 503.25 ‘Ventilation’, ‘5013.2.6 ‘Energy recovery vénti systems’, 503.2.7 ‘Ductand plenum
insulation and sealing’, 503.2.7.1 ‘Duct construction’, 503.2.7: . ow-pressure duct systerrﬁs_f.ﬁSOS.ZJ.l.z
‘Medium-pressure duct systems’, ‘503.2.9

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 13 of 29



Chapter 6: Referenced Standards

CHAPTER 6
REFERENCED STANDARDS

*Revise Chapter 6 ‘Referenced Standards’ to include the following:

AFC

Arkansas Fire Prevention Code
State Fire Marshal’s Office

1 State Police Plaza Drive
Littie Rock, Arkansas 72209

(501) £18-8621
Standard Referenced
referance Code
number Title section number
AFC Arkansas Fire Prevention

COUR s errere i aresarsaransoessssss sinatsssonrseos ersssiansvesssssss

AMC

Arkansas Mechanical Code
Department of Health
Division of Protective Health Codes
4815 West Markham Street, Slot 24
Little Rock, Arkansas 72205-3867
(501)661-2642 . 7

AMC

3.2.5.1, 503.2.6, 503.2.7,
; 08.2.7.1.1, 503.2.7.1.2,
Arkansas Mechanical Code..... i . 503.2.9.1,503.1and 503.4.5

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amengdments

Page 14 of 29



Appendices

Appendices are not enforceable unless they are specifically referenced in the body of the code or local authority

having jurisdiction. These are included to be helpful in meeting and understanding the 2013 Arkansas Energy
Code.

APPENDIX A:

*Add new Appendix A, ‘SAMPLE ORDINANCE’

APPENDIX B:

*Add new Appendix B, ‘AIR SEALING KEY POINTS’

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 15 of 29




APPENDIX A: SAMPLE ORDINANCE

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING MINIMUM ENERGY STANDARDS FOR THE DESIGN OF NEW BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES OR PORTIONS AND ADDITIONS TO EX{STING BUILDINGS THAT PROVIDE FACILITIES OR
SHELTER FOR PUBLIC ASSEMBLY, EDUCATION, BUSINESS, MERCANTILE, INSTITUTUIONAL, STORAGE,
AND RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES, AS WELL AS THOSE PORTIONS OF FACTORY AND INDUSTRIAL
OCCUPANCIES DESIGNED PRIMARILY FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY BY REGULATING [
ENVELOPES AND THE SELECTION OF THEIR HVAC, SERVICE WATER HEATING, El :
DISTRIBUTUION AND ILLUMINATING SYSTEMS AND EQUIPMENT FOR EFFEC

OF ENERGY.

Be in enacted by the City Council of

Section 1. ADOPTION OF ENERGY CODE.

There is hereby adopted by the City Council of
rules and regulations for energy efficient standards for new build
Energy Code, being particularly the 2013 Arkansas Energy Code ed
such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modi r amended, of whi :
well as, three {3) copies of the 2013 Arkansas “ode, have been ar w are filed in the office of the Clerk or
Recorder of the city of : inance Is hereby adopted and incorporated
as fully as if set out at length herein, and from the d; hall take effect, the provisions thereof
shall be controlling in the construction of all building
City of i

Ordinances or pa hall take effect, if inconsistent

herewith,

whereas it is of th
protect the citizen

_, Arkansas, have an up-to date Energy Code to
n Emergency is hereby declared to exist and this ordinance being necessary for
ake effect immediately on its passage and approval.

Signed:

Mayor
(SEAL})

Attest:
City Clerk or Recorder

Date Passed:

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 16 of 29



APPENDIX B: AIR SEALING KEY POINTS

Guide and iflustrations provided by Southface Energy Institute, inc.

Air Barrier and Insulation Inspection Component Guide

NUMBER | COMPONENT CRITERIA

1 Air barrier and thermal barrier Exterior thermal envelope insutation for framed walls is Installed In
substantial contact and continuous alignmant with buliding envelope air
barrier,

Breaks or joints In the alr barrier are filled or repalred.
Air-permeable insulation Is not used as a sealing material.
Alr-permeable insulation Is inside of an air barrier.

2 Celling/attic Alr barrier in any dropped celling/soffit Is substantiatly aligned with
insulation and any gaps are sealed.
Attic access (except unvented attlc), knea wall door. or drop down stair

Is sealed.
3 Walls Cormners and headers are insuiated.
Junction of foundation and sill plate is sealed,

4 Windows and doors Space between vindow/door jambs and framing Is sealed,
Rim jolsts Rim Jolsts are insulated and Include an alr barrier.

6 Floors Insulation s installad to maintain permanent contact with underside of
(including above-garage and subfloor decking. Air barrler is installed at any exposed edge of
cantilevered floors) Insulation,

7 Cravd space walls Insuiation Is permanently attached 1o waljs,

Exposed earth in unvented crav spaces Is coverad with Class | vapor
retarder with overtapping joints taped.

8 Shafts, penetrations Duct shafts, utility penetrations, knee walls and flue shafts opening to
exterior or unconditioned space ars sealed,

9 Narrow cavities Balts In namow cavitles are cut to fit, or namow cavities are filled by
sprayed/blown insulation.

10 Garage separation Alr sealing Is provided between the garage and conditionad spaces.

11 Recessad iighting Recessed light fixiures are air tight, IC rated, and sealed to drywall,

Exception—fixtures in conditioned space,

12 Plumbing and wiring Insulation is placed betwasn cutside and plpes.
Batt insuiation Is cut to fit around wirlng and plumbing, ot
sprayed/blown Insulation extends behind piping and viring.

13 Showet/tub on exterior wall Showers and tubs on exterlor walls have Insulation and an air barrier
saparating them from the exterior wall.
14 Electricaliphone box on exterior | Alr barrier extands behind boxes or air sealed-type boxes are instalied.
walls
15 Common wall Alr barrer is Installed In common wall betwsen dwelilng units.
16 HVAC register boots HVAC register boots that penetrate buikiing envelope are sealed to
subfioor or drywall,
17 Flreplace Fireplace walis include an alr barrier,
Disdaimer:
This document is infended sotely to
help graphicay demonsirate the air
leakage provisions of section 4024
of the 2009 1ECC. It does not cover
af arsealing tocations or
lechiiques. Other cooe provisions
may be applicatie as well,

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Bullding Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 17 of 29



Air sealing key points

Seal lights and
bath vem fans
to celting drywall

Farivenied

thrisugh exteror
wad) sealed at
penstrafion

2

£§) Seel airtight 1C-rated insulate and install Insulsle
secessad fight sheet materal /9 headers
fixtures to drywall behind balklub

112

Insulated exterior

T8

Seal
plurnbing

E%Ege%?s - /’

Seal gap between A i 5 covity batts
electrical box and |, Lo : are g:t 1o fit

drywall H
K e . | kKl Cauk

Elactrical panel box,
recommend install on
interior {non-insulatad) wall.
1 installed on exterior wall,
alr bartier shall extend
behing box o alr-seated
hox shafl be Instalfed.

Seal wirng and
plumbing penetrations

Discialimes.

ThiS doctment Is ETknged solely 19
help graphically dirvastrate the s
aleape provisions of ection 4024 of
meaog_slsoc. K thoos mod pover all

o 3
Ofnet 6oda provisions mirg be
agpleabiy as wel,

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Su pplements and Amendments Page 18 of 29



Air sealing key points continses

Chases and common by-passes

Seal n
chases W
Seal b=
top piate i
Caulk 5
5 eleckical boxes
o and fxtures to
§ drywall
=
=
Y Seal penatrations *
Seal e In common wall [
Dbattomn "
plate & AL

Seal HVAC
panatrations

]
Seal slectical
paneirations

Seal plumbing
penalrations

and insutate above

Cap top of chase
with sofld air bamier
dropped soffil

instad air barrles
on intoriar of all

= \& insulated walls

[RSssm—
L
S
3.
Soal
boltorn
- plate

t) Seal HYAC boot
penefrations

Showerftub drain rough
opening

Install insulation and sealed alr
basrier behing fub {requirec)

¥

X ®

I
e

L
N |

WP Seat bathtub drain penetration

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

Disciaimes:
This document is intenclec solely 10
D raphically demonstiats the ay
provisions of section 402.4 of
e 2008 1ECC. 1 cow not cover all
Arsealing locstiong or (cchniques.
QR Core DICISIONS Mty b
agpdcabio o wel,

Page 19 0f 29



Air sealing key points contined

p—
Window rough opening

Al
venlilation

Glue drywall 1o
top and bokoem plates
(recommended)

Caulk boltom plate
% subfioor

Wall cross-section

Wind wash bale and dam for
alr-permeabie Insulalion

Seq nsulation Deladls

for Colings with
Atlic Spaces.

Sollivent

34nch Insgection yap

Imaulation s
parmanenity aitached
o walls

7 Bl CLASS |
" vapor rotarder
roquirad in crawispace

{recommandead), Caulk bottom piate
to subfloar, foundation, or sleb

Caulk band joist
10 subBoor and plates

o
Use hacker rod of spray foam 3
{appropriate for windows) Yo il gaps ; «b
i i
:mg windowdoar.and caugh Glug drywall io lop plate
L {recommended) Tapa of caulk exterior
w sheathing seams
Glua drywall to botiom plate

Insia exterior
1 waler rasksiive
batrior as por
IRC703.2
{Inderfioor Insulation
must be Instaied in
permaneni contact with
sublioor {ak barrler
roquited at any expesed
pdge of insulalion}
Disclakner.
“This cocuresnt 1s Ederkid sokey fO
halp graphicaty demondirate T AT
k0w of soclion 4024 ot
o 2009 [ECT. R does o conel b
gussatng locations
Other code provigions may be
sopbcabi s wel.

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

Page 20 of 29



Air sealing key points contined

Combustion chase
penetrations

Sea around
chimney flues
with shieet
matal cap

Seal

Aifd foam opion .-~ Iemnal air barrder
{recommend covering  {recommended)

wilh ignition barmter for
fire proteclion}

Blocking above
suporting walk for
canttleverad Roor
{requirad)

Lﬁ;"&:‘iﬂ: Underficor insulation must be

plate of m.stalled in permanent contact

suppering y with subfloor (alr barrer

wall required at any exposed edge
ol insulation)

Combustion closet

Gombuskon air Inlels
as per mechanical and’or fusl gas code

Fiue slack

Exterlor penetrations

Canlk, exterlor wall penetrations tor
relrigeration lines, condansuts line, ate,

agains! solid threshold

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

Seal gas and
plumbing
penetrations
through walls

Instialed

walls (nol required
unless walls are
part of building
tharmal envelope)

Insulated
water haater
{nol required)

Bottorn plate
Sealed

\ Sofid (non-louvarad) door with weathersiripping

This cocu ment b nfancd solely 1o
hedo raphically demaenska® the air
IPAKAQE provisions of sacion 402.4 of
e 2000 JECG. it thoes nal cover b

0 of
Other codh provisions may be
appicatis as wal,

Page 21 of 29




Air sealing key points continued

A-18 insulaiion

R-13 + A-5,
R-15 + B3,
ar R-1% in 26

Caulk and seal
rough apening

e ——
Rigi¢t insulation Weather-strip door
(recommended) opening and
Minimum RS thresholkd
(Georgla requirement)

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

Install blecking and rafter baffie to
prevent wind-washing if venled, insufated
roofline {required}

Sealed attic-side air batrier {required}—

8 0358, insulated sheathing, ele.

Blocking - it in jois! cavity,
caulked or foamac

1

Two-level attic

Unconditioned Space
Alr basier
recjuired, 2
{rigid insulation ﬁ
board recommended) 5
’n;,xs—.r,:!—# S g £
THa

— Blocking

Conditioned Conditioned Space

space
Dlsciatmes:
‘This dogument 18 fitended aolaly (o
netp geaphically demenstraivy the sl
{exlage privisions of seciion 4024 o!

the 2000 IECG, 1t does not oover ol
alrsenling lecabinns of iachnigues,
Cthier code provisions may be
appicable ws woll.

Page 22 of 29



Air sealing key points continued

Attic scuttle

Insulatton darms
prevantioosedil  Halch lid pushes up and

insutation from out of the way for access
fafling through
aALCSss
\ /\ Rigid insulation plus bat! {recommandad)

gasket

Attic puli-down stairs

Rigid insulation box forms lid tor pull-down attic staircase
(recommended) Boxed enclosure for

stalrcase has rigid hinged
lid with Insulation on top

loose-fill Insutation from
falfing through accass
N

Insulation dams provent Cover box pushes up
/} and out of the way for

Neatherstrippin i g Seal gap between frame
—, and rough opening with
i caulk, backer rod, or foam

Attic pull-down stairs

Insulation dams prevent Seal gap betwoon lrame and
loose-fill insulation from rough opening with caul
/ talling through access il o

£
73

e Lyed
3

L TExe
3

. Disclabmer:
insufation board This document Is ARG sokty lo
rinimum R-5 I muc;:mudm;msum mao.e a:w
the 20001ECC, 1 doss rot cover al

Othar code provisiona may be
Bppicabio ns v,

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 23 of 29



Air sealing key points continusd

Adrbarrier
behind steps

Giarage 1o hotrse door

Garage
{unconditioned)

1

AR RRNY

i

H
k|

i

Web russes

Rigld foam
{recommend covering with
ignition barrier, If required)

Basement
{conditionad)

Inset garage 1o house door

Garage
{uncondilioned)

Web iruss M

She?lh and
insutate

Rigid foam
{recommanc coverlng with
ignition barriar, if required)

Basement
{conditioned)

Desclabmes:

This gocursent i3 intandad sokly 1o
holy graphically demonsiinto the ar
feakage proviiiong of section 402.4 of
tho 2004 FECC. B dons not coute &t

ng of q
it GO Howiyions msy be
appicatis as wek,

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 24 of 28



Air sea”ng key pOintS continued

Mechanical Closet
Seal elactrical and plumbing
penetrations and perimeter of
outside air ventilation duct
Seal plenum
panetration

through drywall

LOUVERED DOOR - ™

TRl P Th e R S o ST A A e el DT 12 PR

AlIR

Py

LS S AT

K]
Seal refrigerant . 1
_ penetration : i
ER i
O "~ Ses! plumblr i

penatration

o

Seal perimeter of
drain penetration

iy T e

NN i it

o, YT

NUtility chase
capped and
sealed at
perimeter -
at all levels

UTILITY
CHASE

M soal electrical
and plumbing
penetrations

Utility chase
capped and
sealed at
perimeter -
at atl levals

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

[y,

This document Is Inlended sokty to
help graphically demonstrate the air
taakage provisions ol section 402.4 of
the 2009 JECS. It does not cover o
alrseniing kocations of techniques.
Qther cota provisions may be
appicable as wel,

Page 25 of 29



Air sealing key points continued
Multifamily

Seal-.gap
between levels

FRAMED
MULTI-STORY
LIVING UNITS

srmme

Cayvity insulation
plus exterior
sheathing

Seal
penetrations
through exterior
sheathing

Seal gap
belween levels

L

L]

:

' CONCRETE

) MASONRY UNIT

H STAIRWELL
... or ELEVATOR

: i CHASE

2 i

t i

* H

¢ :

" :

) i

¢ :

] H

s :

» :

» i

i i

N H

i

]

i

g

i

13

4

..

L)

Recommend rigid foam belween
concrale masonry units and
¢ framed stud wall

: Stee! framing regquirements
» R-5 foam raquired i steel studs
+ R-7.5 if greater than 3 stories

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

Seal gap between concrete
wali and framed units at
aach level

Disclatmer:

This decument is intended solety 1o
heip graphically demonsirate the air
Isakage provisions of section 462.4 of
4he 2009 1ECC, It does not cover af
abseating ocallons of tectiques.
Ofher codo provisions may be
appicabie 0s wel.

Page 26 of 29



Building Thermal Envelope

element that enclose conditioned space. This boundary als

uncondifoned space. —2008 IECC

The building thermal envelope is the barier 1hat se)
envelope consists of two parts - an air barrier and
In a typlcal residence, the buliding envalops consi
include atlics, vented crawlspaces, garages, and

Example 1

Condilioned
space

L8N
-
-
lE Conditioned

Garage 5pace

&
H
H
Aw

Basement/
venied
crawlspace

This is a conventicnal approach that
likely locates all ductweork in
unconditioned spaces.

Example R-values’

0 Flat ceiling: R-30

O Exterior walls: R-13 + R-3 sheathing

O Floor over garage and basement/
crawl: R-19

8 Ductwork sealed with mastic and
insulated to R-8 in aflic, R-6 In
basement/crawlspace

O Garagse®, attic and basement/crawl
are unconditioned spaces

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments

— The basement walls, exterior walls, floor, roof, and any other building
o includes the boundary betwesn conditioned space and any exempt or

parates the conditioned space from the outside or unconditioned spaces. The building
& thermal barrier that must be both continuous and contiguous (touching each othar).
sts of the roof, walls, windows, doors, and foundation. Examples of unconditioned spaces

basements with celling insulation and no HVAGC supply registers.

Example 2

Vauited
conditioned
space

Conditioned
space

Basement 2
{conditioned or 3]

Important alr
sealing location

If supply registers deliver conditioned

air to basement, it is considared

conditioned. With no supply air, itis

considered an indirectly-conditioned

space.

Example R-values'

O Fiat celting: B-38

O Kneewalls: R-18 {required)
(R-13+ R-5, R-15+ R-3, R-19in 246)

Vaulted ceiling®: R-19 air-permeabls
Insulation plus R-5 rigid foam board

Exterlor walls: R-13
Basement masonry walls: R-5
Basement slab®: R-0

Duciwork sealed with mastic and
insulated to R-8 in attic, R-8 in
basemaent

Garage® and atlic are unconditioned
spaces

oaooaogag o

o

Example 3

Indirectlysconditioned
space <

Conditioned
space

TIIIIIIIIII

Condgitioned

Garage space

J BAERNEE

[ ]
s
B

2=
£
il
pas

The top conditioned floor functions

as a vaulted ceiling with interior walls
althought 1t appears to have kneewalls
and a flat ceiling. An advantage of this
approach is that all upstairs ductwork is
located inside the bullding envelope.

The crawispace wails are insulated and
do not contaln vents. The crawlspace
ground is covarad with concrete or
100% plastic and functions as a “minl-
basement.”

Exampia R-values'

0O Vaulted celling®: R-19
air-impermeable foam Insutalion

0  Exlerior walls: R-13 + R-3 sheathing
B Crawlspace walls: R-5
0

Ductwork sealed with mastic and
Insulated to R-8

O Garage® is unconditioned space

Page 27 of 29



Insulation Details for Ceilings with Attic spaces :

Rafter and Truss
Note: Wind wash baflie and
Standard Truss air-permeable Insulation
, dam. For air permeable
with tapered insulation In vented atlics,

insulation depth Insulation bafile atfles shall be installed
adjacent io soffit and eave
vents. A minimurn of a 3-inch

of space shall be provided

insulation inward unfil itis al
teas! 4 inches varlically above
tha top of the insulation. Any

insulafio Yo s between the Insulation and the
,:_]' . Soffit dam foof sheathing and at the
; et (cardboard or {pcation of the vent. The baffie
\ m rigid foam board) shall extend over the‘top of the
i

Energy Truss solid material such as
with full height insulation -czrdbgard o; 1::i2 insu[at)insgm
L sheathing shall ba permissible
{recommended) Insulation baffta as the baffle,
_ Soffll dam
{cardboard or rigid
4 | foam board}
Q Saoffit vent
Standard rafter
and top plate
with tapered )
insulaton depth Insuiation baffle
Insul
Soffit dam
{cardboard of rigid
toam hoard)
1!
Rafter on raised top plate
with full height insulation Minimum 1-inch depth
inimum 1-inch dep
{recommended} for insulation baffle
Soffit dam
! {cardboard or rigid
Insulation . foam board)
Ralsed top plate
1 A Distlaimen:
o A This documment Is intanded sokly to
e oo
08 piov 40
Q Soffit vent the 2008 1ECG, Itrioes notcaver al
slraeabing locallons of techniuas.
Ofher codé povisions may be
; applicable 85 well,

2012 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 28 of 29



Roofline Installed Insulation Options

Air impermeable

instailed insulation
{e.0., spray foam insulation) Shinglas

Roofing feit

Dacking

Air impermeable insuiation
{8.g.. apen- or closed-
coll spray foam)

Air impermeabls insulalion
R-19 minimum if trade-offs are used
{Georgia requirements)

Ait impermeable insulation

{e.g. rigid foam board)

R-5 minimum in ¢limats zones2& 3
R-15 minimum in climale zone 4

Air-permeable Shingles

installed insulation
{e.g. fiberglass, celivlose)

Option 1 Roofing felt

Air jmpermeable insulation
{e.g. rigid foam board)
\

Decking
Air-permeable insulation

R-19 minimum if trade-ofis are used
{Georgia requirements)

Alr-permeable insulation

Shingles

Option 2
Roofing felt

Air Impermeable insulation

{e.9. rigid foam board)

R-5 minimum in chmate zones 2 & 3
R-15 minimum In cfimats zone 4

Dacking

At impermeable insulation

{e.g. rigid foam board) Disclaimer:
Trids documant Is intended sokaty 1o
Alr-permeabla insulation . ) hely graphicaly demonsirake the ak
Alr-permeable insulation ng& pll'gvccislonsolsecuon 4024 ot
. i ; the . W ¢iaes nol cover al
R-19 minimum :I'_lrade—oits airsoaling locatlons of 1aoNUES.
are used (Georgia Citver cotks provisions may be
¢ requiremants) apphcabhy a5 well,

2013 Arkansas Energy Code for new Building Construction Supplements and Amendments Page 29 of 29








