Holliday, Karen

From: Holliday, Karen

Sent: Woednesday, September 23, 2015 11:03 AM
To: ‘Andrew Marsh'

Subject: RE: Request from Rep. Hammer

Mr. Marsh,

[ apologize for adding to your workload. I have received an additional request from Rep. Hammer.

Along with the breakout of the payments and deliverable dates, have procurement or DHS breakdown the justification
of payments and what services were provided with each payment for the CoCentrix contract.

Is this information available through DHS or do I need to contact OSP?

Thank you,
Karen

From: Holliday, Karen

Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2015 4:41 PM
To: 'Andrew Marsh'

Cc: Hammer Kim

Subject: RE: Request from Rep. Hammer

Mr. Marsh,

Thank you for your willingness to provide the requested documents. Receipt of the documents by Friday will be
acceptable. That would allow me to get the documents to Rep. Hammer for his review over the weekend. Please
let me know if you have any questions or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Karen Holliday

Bureau of Legislative Research

From: Andrew Marsh [mailto:Andrew.Marsh@dhs.arkansas.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2015 4:25 PM

To: Holliday, Karen
Subject: RE: Request from Rep. Hammer

Ms. Holliday,
You made a request under the Freedom of Information Act, and 1 am writing to confirm receipt.

| sent your request to the point of contact in our Office of Finance and Administration to search for responsive
documents. Also, | identified a significant number of e-mails possibly responsive. | respectfully request a brief extension
of time in order for our FOIA team to review and fully produce these records. | anticipate that we can have them by this
Friday; will that be acceptable? Thank you for working with us on this.

Sincerely,
Andrew Marsh
Arkansas Department of Human Services

Legal Services Specialist
Office of Chief Counsel
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P.O. Box 1437, 5260

Little Rock, AR 72203-1437
Telephone: {501) 320-6347
Facsimile: {501) 682-8009
Andrew.Marsh@dhs.arkansas.gov

Confidentiality Notice: This email message (including attachments} is the property of the State of Arkansas and may be
protected by state and federal laws governing disclosure of private information. It is intended only for the use of the
individual or eritity to which this email is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent
responsible for delivering the message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that reading, copying or
distribbution this transmission is strictly prohibited. The sender has not waived any applicable privilege by sending the
accompanying transmission. if you have received this transmission in ervor, please notify the sender and delete the
message and attachments from your system. '

From: Craig Cloud

Sent: Monday, September 21, 2015 8:50 AM
To: Stephenie Blocker; Brian Bowen; Brad Nye
Subject: Fwd: Request from Rep. Hammer

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Holliday, Karen" <karenh@hblr.arkansas.gov>

Date: September 21, 2015 at 8:32:41 AM CDT

To: 'Craig Cloud' <Craig.Cloud@dhs.arkansas.gov>

Cc: Tim Lampe <Tim.Lampe@dhs.arkansas.gov>, "Mark White (DHS)" <Mark.White@dhs.arkansas.gov>,
‘David Sterling' <David.Sterling@dhs.arkansas.gov>, Hammer Kim <HammerKim@arkleg.state.ar.us>,
'Dick Wyatt' <Richard.Wyatt@dhs.arkansas.gov>

Subject: Request from Rep. Hammer

Good marning Mr. Cloud,

Rep. Hammer has requested copies of all emails between any DHS employee and Cocentrix in the
last 60 days please. In addition, he wants the DHS pay history to CoCentrix from the beginning of
their hire right up until this Monday. Please include a schedule of delivery dates, if CoCentrix was
late, and if they received payment in spite of being late. Our email server won't allow email
attachments larger than 10 MB to come through our system. You may have to put the emails on a
CD and call me when it is ready and I can pick it up.

The next update from DHS and CoCentrix will be at the Oct. 2, 2015 meeting of the [PR Committee.
He would like to have the emails in time to review them before the Oct. 20¢d meeting. Thank you in
advance for your efforts to get the emails and other information requested to us before the meeting.

Sincerely,
Karen

Keren Hollidzy

Senior Legisiative Analyst
Bureau of Legisiative Research
One Capitof Mall, 5th Floor
Little Rock, AR 72201
501-537-9167
karenh@bir.arkansas.gov




Holliday, Karen

From: Holliday, Karen

Sent; Tuesday, September 22, 2015 9:12 AM

To: kimdavidhammer@gmail.com

Ce: Hammer Kim

Subject: Testimony at JPR-Withholding Payment to CoCenfrix
Attachments: CoCentrix Withhold Funding.docx

Importance: High

Rep. Hammer,

Please find in the attachment above, the transcripts (word-for-word} ffrom the four JPR Committee meetings where
DHS and CoCentrix discussed the status of the CoCentrix contract and the Universal Assessment Tool software and
DHS holding payment to CoCentrix until they are satisfied with the product. Wanda listened to the recordings to
retrieve what was said, per your request for this information.

Karen

Karen Hollidzy

Senior Legislative Analyst
Bureau of Legislative Research
One Capitol Mall, 5th Floor
Little Rock, AR 72201
501-537-9167
karenh@blr.arkansas.qgov




CoCENTRIX and DHS DISCUSSION—HOLDING PAYMENTS

JPR Committee Meetings

JPR Committee Meeting May 18

Tim Lampe, Division of Medical Services, Office of Program Management Director, Arkansas
Department of Human Services (DHS)

Tim Lampe--We are withholding $310,000 to CoCENTRIX

Senator Flowers--you are withholding that because they have not delivered something that was
due three weeks ago?

Tim Lampe--we had a 3 month schedule delay - we are withholding payment until they deliver it on
May 12" and until we satisfactorily test it

Senator Hickey--the original contract was $65,000. How much was it-- was it just that $65,000 that
was given before that delay was reported?

Tim Lampe--that was a sole source contract that we put together

Senator Hickey--Do you remember in the Legislative Audit meeting, there was a question as it
relates to the CoCENTIX contract — Legislative Audit was told the contract amount was $6.1 million?

Tim Lampe—that was incorrect
Senator Hickey--the $6.1 million? | hear we have spent $9.1 million?

Representative Hammer to John Malcolm, CoCENTRIX --what was the contract amount that
you had in mind when you bid on this?

John Malcolm--our initial contract amount was over a five-year term. | believe it was $19 million
initially, and there was restructuring led by Tim Lampe to reduce it down to $16 million over five
years

Representative Hammer--you are about $9.1 million into it the $16 million?

You are at about $6 million to finish the project, that leaves you about $6 million to finish the project

JPR Committee Meeting June 17

Representative Hammer--why are we holding their money, and how long are we going to hold their
money?

Craig Cloud—We are holding dollars, there are major issues with functionality. We continue to hold
payment, and will continue to hold payment until we are satisfied that they have ability to meet the
deliverables for which they have been contracted




JPR Committee Meeting July 30

Representative Hammer recognized Craig Cloud, Director of Aging and Aduit Services,
Department of Human Services

Representative Hammer--would you give us an update on where we are with CoCENTRIX
Representative Hammer--are you still withholding money from CoCENTRIX?

Craig Cloud--Yes, we have a $300,000 invoice that | have been holding. We will continue to hold
that invoice until we know sufficiently that they are able to deliver the next deliverable, which is due
August 14" which will be the completion of Phase |

Representative Hammer--you are holding $300,000, the total amount for this contract Craig?
Craig Cloud--Approximately $9.2 million has been paid to date, and an invoice has been presented
for $300,000. 1 am continuing to hold that, there will no further payment until we choose the
direction for Phase Il and Phase Il

Representative Hammer--do you expect after they deliver on the 14", that if it is successful, you
can sign off on it and you are going to get an additional invoice that is going to go above what you
are holding and what they have already been paid? Or, have they been drawing ahead of what the
work has actually been performing and they are in catch up mode?

Craig Cloud--drawing ahead, and at the completion of this Phase 1 there will be no payment other
than the $300,000 we are holding

JPR Committee Meeting September 10, 2015

Craig Cloud, Director of Aging and Adult Services, Department of Human Services
Representative Hammer--are you still withholding any payments?

Craig Cloud—yes, we continue to hold the $385,000 payment, and will continue to do so until we
understand that we have the full functionality. | might add that CoCENTRIX in pushing the key
deliverables. Yesterday that was a key push for us to have those in our environment and if we
move forward and test successfully over the next few weeks | anticipate being able to approve, with
the approval of DHS and the administration, the release of those dollars

Representative Hammer--are we coming in under budget, on budget, over budget?

Craig Cloud--right now what has actually been spent for $9.1 million to date is actually for what is
on for Phase |. Obviously, the remainder of the project will have to be reviewed at that time for
potential changes or modifications. The original agreement was right at the $16 million, so there is
approximately $6 million that remains to be spent We will have to utilize those dollars and review
our new Statement of Work. Also, the contracting entity that we work through now, SHI, will no
longer be available. So, we will have to look at a separate contract with CoCENTRIX for the
remainder of that contract and move forward to ensure that we have deliverables and a Statement
of Work in place. Our goal is to ensure that the project can be completed at the originaily
established budget that was established a year ago when the project was procured



Holliday, Karen

From: Hoilliday, Karen

Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2015 5:43 PM
To: Hammer Kim; 'Kim Hammer'

Subject: FW: CoCentrix Payment History
Attachments: CoCentrix Payment History.pdf
Importance: High

Rep. Hammer,

See the attachment above. The 3 paymentsissued on 9/17 /2015 were recalled at the request of Craig Cloud on
Sept. 18. See the emails below. See bottom of the chart in the attachment for the checks recalled and their
amounts.

Karen

From: Andrew Marsh [mailto:Andrew.Marsh@dhs.arkansas.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2015 5:01 PM

To: Holliday, Karen

Subject: CoCentrix Payment History

Importance: High

Karen,
Attached is a detailed payment history between DHS and CoCentrix since the beginning of the contract.
Andrew

From: Craig Cloud

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2015 4:18 PM
To: Dick Wyatt

Cc: Tim Lampe; Mark White (DHS); John Selig
Subject: Re: CoCentrix Services - SHI Quotes

Thanks, Dick. Yes, please stop payment until we can discuss this further.
Craig

CRAIG A. CLOUD

Director

Division of Aging and Adult Services
PO Box 1437 Slot 5530

Little Rock, AR 72203-1437

Phone: 501-682-2441

Fax - 501-682-8155

craig.cloud @dhs.arkansas.gov

On Sep 18, 2015, at 4:07 PM, Dick Wyatt <Richard.Wyatt@dhs.arkansas.gov> wrote:

No problem for me....that is why | send the message to all of you. Just let me know who makes the final decision. fam
just doing what | am told. At this point, we have just entered but not approved the purchase requisition and Misty had a
newer version of the Request for purchase approval form so the PR has not been released. We did pay for some
training, reporting and implementation services. Do | need to see if | can stop that?
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Dick

From: Craig Cloud

Sent: Friday, September 18, 2015 4:02 PM

To: Dick Wyatt <Richard. Wyatt@dhs.arkansas.gov>; Tim Lampe <Jim.Lampe@dhs.arkansas.gov>
Cc: Mark White (DHS) <Mark.White @dhs.arkansas.gov>; John Selig <John.Selig@dhs.arkansas.gov>
Subject: FW: CoCentrix Services - SHI Quotes

Dick/Tim,

After the Legislative Audit meeting this morning, Tim advised me that you and he were working on processing a
payment of up to $600,000 to CoCentrix for maintenance of licenses and initial work for additional development of the
portal beyond Phase 1. We understood previously that we owned the licenses, and Michael Kunzer of Cognasante had
researched whether we needed to pay for additional maintenance. | understand per emails sent to me today by Tim
that Michael Kunzer is working on a revised statement of work and charter to include deliverables for work beyond
Phase 1. | also understand that the CoCentrix contract can no longer be supported under the SHI agreement and we at
some point must seek to contract directly with them through a ‘sole-source’ process for completion of work under the
UAT preject.

While CoCentrix has made tremendous progress, and we are moving in a positive direction, | have reservations about
processing additional payments to CoCentrix until we have complete certainty of their ability to deliver a functional
product for which they have already received payment. In fact, | made such assertions at JPR that no further payments
would be authorized by the department until we were satisfied that Phase 1 had been delivered and was fully
functional. The next few weeks are critical to our monitoring and ensuring their ability to deliver a product that can ‘Go-
Live’ for DDS and DAAS. | want to make sure we have complete transparency and credibility with the Governor’s office,
as well as the legislature considering our past concerns and issues. Processing a payment without full assurance that
Phase 1 will go live doesn’t send a good signal. Further, significant payment to this vendor has already been paid without
a functioning product being delivered.

Can we not meet internally on this issue and with CoCentrix next week to discuss, and then seek guidance prior to
approving any additional payments for additional services for which there is no SOW? | appreciate your understanding
of my concerns.

Thanks,
Craig

CRAIG A. CLOUD

Director

Division of Aging and Adult Services
PO Box 1437 Slot 530

Little Rock, AR 72203-1437

Phone: 501-682-2441

Fax - 501-682-8155
craig.cloud@dhs.arkansas.gov

From: Dick Wyatt

Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2015 10:59 AM

To: OST Purchasing

Cc: Tim Lampe; Mark White (DHS); John Selig; Craig Cloud
Subject: FW: CoCentrix Services - SHI Quotes



Please create a purchase requisition for the annual renewal of CoCentrix licenses.

TPC for the PR should be $8,056,444.00

Charges will go to 418262 — HCQX0314 - 5100001000

i will start to work on the submission form for approval to purchase that you can attach to the PR.

Thanks,
Dick
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