



FY2018 Treasurer Professional Fees Expenditures

				Original Appropriation	\$194,375
Date	Vendor	Purpose	Amount	Remaining Appropriation	
07/24/2017	MWSG*	Legal Fees	\$2,788	\$191,587	
08/25/2017	MWSG*	Legal Fees	\$5,534	\$186,054	

*Mitchell, Williams, Selig & Gates Law Firm
Information from Statewide Accounting System (AASIS)

MITCHELL || WILLIAMS

Arkansas
•Little Rock•Rogers•Jonesboro
Texas
•Austin

425 West Capitol Avenue, Suite 1800
Little Rock, AR 72201-3525
Telephone 501-688-8800
Fax 501-688-8807

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER
MR. DENNIS MILLIGAN
ATTN: BUSINESS OFFICE
1401 W. CAPITOL AVE., SUITE 275
LITTLE ROCK, AR 72201

AUGUST 18, 2017
INVOICE NO. 1122578

CLIENT NO.
030470-0001

(PLEASE DETACH THIS PORTION AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

A C C O U N T S U M M A R Y

RE: DAVID SINGER

LEGAL SERVICES PERFORMED	4,561.00
COSTS EXPENDED	972.60
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	<u>5,533.60</u>

Name	Init.	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
B. FREELAND	BF	Partner	275.00	11.30	3,107.50
K. GRAVES	KG	Partner	265.00	0.40	106.00
G. C. TALLEY	GCT	Associate	175.00	7.70	1,347.50
					<u>4,561.00</u>

CUMULATIVE FEES: 327,382.00 CUMULATIVE EXPENSES: 13,995.59

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SBLIG, GATES & WOODYARD, P.L.L.C. | ATTORNEYS AT LAW
MITCHELLWILLIAMS.COM

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION
NO. 71-0261429

BALANCE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT UNLESS PRIOR ARRANGEMENTS HAVE BEEN MADE
PLEASE REMIT TO THE LITTLE ROCK OFFICE

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 2

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/05/17	BF	REVIEW MOTIONS AND BRIEFS TO BE ARGUED BEFORE THE COURT IN JULY 6 HEARING	.70
07/05/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S AMENDED NOTICE OF APPEAL	.10
07/05/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO CONTINUE	.10
07/05/17	GCT	BEGIN PREPARING FOR MOTIONS HEARING SCHEDULED FOR JULY 6	1.00
07/06/17	BF	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON PENDING MOTIONS	.40
07/06/17	BF	APPEAR IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT FOR HEARING ON PENDING MOTIONS	.70
07/06/17	BF	REVIEW OUTLINE OF PLAINTIFF'S DEPOSITION RE WHISTLEBLOWER CLAIMS IN PREPARATION FOR TRIAL IF THE TRIAL IS NOT REMOVED FROM THE DOCKET	.50
07/06/17	KG	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S BRIEF IN RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS AND DISCUSS HEARING ON ISSUE	.30
07/06/17	KG	ANALYZE EFFECT OF DENIAL OF MOTION TO DISMISS AND PROCEDURE RE INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL	.00
07/06/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO DISMISS PLAINTIFF'S SECOND AMENDED COMPLAINT	.80
07/06/17	GCT	FINISH PREPARING FOR MOTIONS HEARING OF JULY 6	.50
07/06/17	GCT	ATTEND AND ARGUE AT MOTIONS HEARING	.70
07/06/17	GCT	DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER BASED ON JUDGE PIAZZA'S RULINGS DURING JULY 6 MOTIONS HEARING	.20
07/06/17	GCT	DRAFT EMAIL TO JUDGE PIAZZA'S LAW CLERK RE PROPOSED ORDER FROM JULY 6 MOTIONS HEARING	.10
07/06/17	GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ARKANSAS CASES RE INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF MOTION TO DISMISS BASED ON SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY	1.20

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 3

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/07/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BETH ANN RANKIN RE TRIAL STATUS	.20
07/07/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.J. FOWLER RE TRIAL STATUS	.20
07/07/17	BF	REVIEW CASE DOCUMENTS, EXHIBITS FROM FEDERAL COURT TRIAL AND TESTIMONY FROM FEDERAL COURT TRIAL TO PREPARE FOR TRIAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT	6.70
07/07/17	KG	REVIEW APPELLANT'S COUNSEL'S RESPONSE TO MOTION TO SHOW CAUSE WHY BRIEF NOT FILED IN THE EIGHTH CIRCUIT APPEAL OF FEDERAL COURT CASE	.10
07/07/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF RESPONSE TO ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE	.10
07/07/17	GCT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE PIAZZA'S TRIAL COURT ASSISTANT RE PROPOSED ORDER AND TRIAL SETTING	.10
07/09/17	GCT	DRAFT NOTICE OF APPEAL FOR INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL FROM STATE COURT CASE	.30
07/09/17	GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ARKANSAS CASES RE STAY OF CIRCUIT COURT PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL IN PREPARATION TO DRAFT MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL IN STATE COURT CASE	.50
07/09/17	GCT	DRAFT MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL IN STATE COURT CASE	.40
07/10/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE'S CASE COORDINATOR RE TRIAL STATUS IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/10/17	BF	REVIEW DRAFT OF NOTICE OF APPEAL FOR INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF STATE COURT CASE	.10
07/10/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.J. FOWLER	.20
07/10/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF ORDER DISSOLVING SHOW CAUSE ORDER FOR APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN EIGHTH CIRCUIT APPEAL OF FEDERAL COURT CASE	.10

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 4

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/10/17	GCT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE PIAZZA'S LAW CLERK RE STATUS OF PROPOSED ORDER DENYING MOTION TO DISMISS PLAINTIFF'S SECOND AMENDED COMPLAINT	.10
07/10/17	GCT	DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/10/17	GCT	DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE PIAZZA RE FILING OF NOTICE OF APPEAL AND MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL	.30
07/10/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL	.30
07/11/17	BF	REVIEW ORDER FROM COURT RE TRIAL DATE AND APPEAL IN STATE COURT CASE	.10
07/11/17	BF	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSE TO DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR STAY OF PROCEEDINGS IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/11/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BETH ANN RANKIN RE TRIAL IS OFF OF THE DOCKET IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/11/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JILL RYDER RE TRIAL IS OFF OF THE DOCKET IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/11/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.J. FOWLER RE TRIAL IS OFF OF THE DOCKET IN STATE COURT CASE	.20
07/11/17	BF	REVIEW JUDGE FOX'S ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO DISMISS ON SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY ISSUE IN UNIVERSITY OF ARKANSAS CASE BEFORE ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT	.30
07/11/17	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF ORDER GRANTING MEMORANDUM MOTION TO STAY PROCEEDINGS PENDING APPEAL IN STATE COURT CASE	.10
07/24/17	GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE APPELLATE RULES RE INTERLOCUTORY APPEALS IN PREPARATION TO LODGE RECORD	.30
07/31/17	BF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CIRCUIT CLERK'S OFFICE RE APPEAL RECORD IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF STATE COURT CASE	.20

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 5

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/31/17 GCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLERK'S OFFICE RE .20
RECORD ON APPEAL AND NOTICE OF APPEAL FILED
BY PLAINTIFF

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 6

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/03/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/03/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.40
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.40
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	9.80
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.80
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	28.00
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	2.00
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.80
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.40
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	2.00
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.80
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.60
07/05/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.40
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	1.40
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.70
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	1.10
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	1.00
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	1.30
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.40
07/06/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	2.60
07/10/17	CIRCUIT CLERK - PULASKI COUNTY - FEE FOR CERTIFIED COPIES OF ALL PLEADINGS TO LODGE INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF STATE COURT CASE	71.50
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.20
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.30
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17	DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

FILE 030470-0001

PAGE 7

RE: DAVID SINGER

07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.40
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.40
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/10/17 MESSENGER DELIVERY OF DOCUMENTS	10.00
07/10/17 OBTAIN CERTIFIED COPIES OF PLEADINGS FROM COURT CLERK	10.00
07/11/17 COURT REPORTER - JUDY AMMONS, RPR, CRR - CERTIFIED TRANSCRIPTS OF FOUR-DAY JURY TRIAL HELD 1/30/17 - 2/3/17 BEFORE JUDGE MILLER	818.10
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.20
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.20
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.30
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.30
07/11/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
07/12/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/24/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	0.10
07/24/17 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10
TOTAL COSTS:	972.60

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY:

DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (630 items @ 0.10):	63.00
CIRCUIT CLERK	71.50
COURT REPORTER	818.10
MESSENGER DELIVERY OF DOCUMENTS	10.00
OBTAIN	10.00
TOTAL:	<u>972.60</u>

CHECK REQUEST

July 10, 2017

PAYEE:: LARRY CRANE, PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT CLERK
401 W. MARKHAM ST.
LITTLE ROCK, AR 72201

AMOUNT: \$71.50

FOR: CERTIFIED COPIES OF ALL PLEADINGS TO LODGE
INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF PULASKI COUNTY CASE

CLIENT NUMBER: 30470-1

CLIENT NAME: MILLIGAN: Singer

REQUESTED BY: BF:sel

CHECK NO.:

**UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF ARKANSAS**

INVOICE NO: 20170029

MAKE CHECKS PAYABLE TO:

Kathlyn Graves
Mitchell, Williams, Selig, Gates &
Woodyard, PLLC
425 West Capitol, Suite 1800
Little Rock, AR 72201
Phone: (501) 688-8831

JUDY AMMONS, RPR, CRR
United States Court Reporter
500 West Capitol, Suite C411
Little Rock, AR 72201

Phone: (501) 604-5165

kgraves@mwlaw.com

jaammons@gmail.com

CRIMINAL

CIVIL

DATE ORDERED:

06-06-2017

DATE DELIVERED:

06-06-2017

Case Style: , v

Certified transcripts of four-day jury trial held 1/30/17 - 2/3/17 before Judge Miller.

Transcript delivered via e-mail in pdf format. Transcript filed.

CATEGORY	ORIGINAL			1ST COPY			2ND COPY			TOTAL CHARGES
	PAGES	PRICE	SUBTOTAL	PAGES	PRICE	SUBTOTAL	PAGES	PRICE	SUBTOTAL	
Ordinary		3.65		909	0.90	818.10		0.60		818.10
14-Day		4.25			0.90			0.60		
Expedited		4.85			0.90			0.60		
Daily		6.05			1.20			0.90		
Hourly		7.25			1.20			0.90		
Realtime		3.05			1.20					
Misc. Desc.	MISC. CHARGES:									
TOTAL:									818.10	
LESS DISCOUNT FOR LATE DELIVERY:										
TAX (If Applicable):										
LESS AMOUNT OF DEPOSIT:										
TOTAL REFUND:										
TOTAL DUE:									\$818.10	

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Full price may be charged only if the transcript is delivered within the required time frame. For example, if an order for expedited transcript is not completed and delivered within seven (7) calendar days, payment would be at the ordinary delivery rate.

CERTIFICATION

I certify that the transcript fees charged and page format used comply with the requirements of this court and the Judicial Conference of the United States.

SIGNATURE:

/s/ Judith A. Ammons

DATE

06-06-2017