J

F 14	2018 Treasurer	riviessional		ures
			Original	
			Appropriation	\$194,375
				Remaining
Date	Vendor	Purpose	Amount	Appropration
07/24/2017	MWSG*	Legal Fees	\$2,788	\$191,587
08/25/2017	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$5,534	\$186,054
09/27/2017	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$20,285	\$165,769
10/16/2017	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$10,958	\$154,811
11/16/2017	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$247	\$154,564
12/31/2017	No Expenditures			\$154,564
01/22/2018	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$744	\$153,820
02/16/2018	Michael Wilson	Attorney Fees	\$699	\$153,121
02/22/2018	MWSG	Legal Fees Legal Fees -	\$858	\$152,263
02/22/2018	Rose Law Firm	Investments	\$2,244	\$150,019
03/28/2018	MWSG	Legal Fees	\$10,947	\$139,072
		YTD Expended	\$55,303	3

^{*}Mitchell, Williams, Selig & Gates Law Firm Information from Statewide Accounting System (AASIS)

MITCHELL | WILLIAMS

Arkansas

·Little Rock · Rogers · Jonesboro

Texas

Austin

425 West Capitol Avenue, Suite 1800 Little Rock, AR 72201-3525 Telephone 501-688-8800 Fax 501-688-8807

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

MR. DENNIS MILLIGAN

ATTN: BUSINESS OFFICE

1401 W. CAPITOL AVE., SUITE 275

LITTLE ROCK, AR 72201

FEBRUARY 16, 2018

INVOICE NO. 1128907

CLIENT NO. 030470-0001

(PLEASE DETACH THIS PORTION AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

RE: DAVID SINGER

LEGAL SERVICES PERFORMED

856.00

COSTS EXPENDED

2,40

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

858.40

Name	Init.	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
B. FREELAND K. GRAVES G. C. TALLEY	BF KG GCT	Partner Partner Associate	275.00 265.00 175.00	0.40 0.90 2.90	110.00 238.50 507.50

CUMULATIVE FEES:

357,127.00 CUMULATIVE EXPENSES:

17,342.64

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD, P.L.L.C. | ATTORNEYS AT LAW MITCHELLWILLIAMSLAW.COM

> **EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION** NO. 71-0261429

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

RE: DAV	ID SI	INGER	
01/18/18	BF	REVIEW ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT OPINION IN UNIVERSITY OF ARKANSAS BOARD OF TRUSTEES VS. ANDREWS	.40
01/18/18	KG	ANALYZE SUPREME COURT DECISION IN UAMS VS. ANDREWS	.40
01/18/18	KG	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.J. FOWLER RE ANDREWS CASE AND STATUS OF OUR INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL	.30
01/18/18	GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ANDREWS DECISION ISSUED BY ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT RE SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY	.90
01/18/18	GCT	DRAFT EMAIL TO MR. T.J. FOWLER RE ANDREWS DECISION ISSUED BY ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT	.20
01/18/18	GCT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. TJ FOWLER AND KATHY GRAVES RE NEXT STEPS IN ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT APPEAL FOLLOWING ISSUANCE OF ANDREWS DECISION	.20
01/19/18	KG	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH T.J. FOWLER CONCERNING THE ARKANSAS WHISTLE BLOWER ACT	.20
01/19/18	GCT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH KYLE BURTON AT ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT RE BRIEFING SCHEDULE	.20
01/19/18	GCT	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF NEW BRIEFING SCHEDULE	.10
01/19/18	GCT	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER RE NEW BRIEFING SCHEDULE	.10
01/19/18	GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE RECORD AND PLEADINGS AND TRANSCRIPT THEREIN IN PREPARATION TO DRAFT APPELLANT'S BRIEF	1.20

FILE 030470-0001 PAGE

2

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER	FILE 030470-0001	PAGE 3
RE: DAVID SINGER		
01/18/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS 01/19/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS 01/19/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (NOT A DUPLICATE) 01/19/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	1.90 0.10 0.10 0.30	
TOTAL COSTS:	2.4	0
DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY:		
DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS (24 items @ 0.10):	2.	40
TOTAL:	2.	40



February 16, 2018

Billed through: February 16, 2018

INVOICE #:

108982 - 00001 - 108023

JMF

Please make checks payable to ROSE LAW FIRM (TAX ID#71-0438614)

Arkansas State Treasurer 500 Woodlane Street, Suite 220 Little Rock, AR 72201

Investments and Public Finance Counsel

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/26/18	JMF	Review Randolph County nursing home information	0.30	hrs
01/31/18	JMF	Provide and brief Tori G-J on questions for Randolph County Nursing Home	0.20	hrs
01/31/18	TGJ	Review statutes and regulations regarding the State Treasurer's Money Management Trust; Draft correspondence analyzing and summarizing findings	1.23	hrs
02/01/18	JMF	Review Tori G-J research; Research legislative audit information for county; Review 2003 county ordinance	1.20	hrs
02/01/18	TGJ	Call with Randolph County Clerk's office regarding documents related to the Randolph County Nursing Home	0.42	hrs
02/02/18	JMF	Prepare draft of memorandum to client	1.20	hrs
02/05/18	JMF	Revise and complete Randolph County Nursing Home memo	0.60	hrs
02/13/18	JMF	Research eligibility of NW Ark Reg Airport to invest in STMMT; Draft memorandum	1.80	hrs
02/13/18	JMF	Revise memorandum on NWARA	0.25	hrs
02/14/18	JMF	Final revision and transmit memo on NWARA-STMMT	0.20	hrs
		TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER	\$2,244	1.00

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE	\$2,244.00
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE	\$2,244.00

MITCHELL | WILLIAMS

Arkansas ·Little Rock · Rogers · Jonesboro

Texas · Austin 425 West Capitol Avenue, Suite 1800 Little Rock, AR 72201-3525 Telephone 501-688-8800 Fax 501-688-8807

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER

MR. DENNIS MILLIGAN

ATTN: BUSINESS OFFICE

1401 W. CAPITOL AVE., SUITE 275

LITTLE ROCK, AR 72201

MARCH 16, 2018

INVOICE NO. 1130582

CLIENT NO. 030470-0001

(PLEASE DETACH THIS PORTION AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT)

ACCOUNT SUMMARY

RE: DAVID SINGER

LEGAL SERVICES PERFORMED

10,937.00

COSTS EXPENDED

9.60

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

10,946.60

Name	Init.	Position	Rate	Hours	Amount
B. FREELAND K. GRAVES G. C. TALLEY L. R. KLAMA	BF KG GCT LRK	Partner Partner Associate Paralegal	275.00 265.00 175.00 100.00	15.70 1.30 34.60 2.20	4,317.50 344.50 6,055.00 220.00
CUMULATIVE FEES:	368,064.00	CUMULATI	VE EXPENS	SES:	17,352.24

MITCHELL, WILLIAMS, SELIG, GATES & WOODYARD, P.L.L.C. | ATTORNEYS AT LAW MITCHELLWILLIAMSLAW.COM

> **EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION** NO. 71-0261429

PAGE

2

	ARKAN	ISAS	S STATE TREASURER	FILE	030470-0001
RE:	DAVID) SI	INGER		-
02/01	/18 G	CT	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER RE TREASURY'S POSITION ON ANDREWS DECISION		.20
02/01	/18 G	CT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER R LUTHER SUTTER'S RECENT MEDIA STATEMENT	E	.10
02/01	/18 G	CT	REVIEW VIDEO OF LUTHER SUTTER'S APPEARANCE LOCAL RADIO DISCUSSING ANDREWS DECISION	ON	.40
02/07	/18 G	CT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ANDREWS MANDATE ENTERED BY ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT)	.10
02/07	/18 G	CT	DRAFT EMAIL TO MR. T.J. FOWLER RE ANDREWS MANDATE		.20
02/08	/18 B		REVIEW APPELLANT'S BRIEF AND ARGUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR ORAL ARGUMENT AT EIGHTH CIRCUIT COURT OF APPEALS IN ST. LOUIS	1	2.60
02/09	/18 B		REVIEW APPELLATE BRIEFS AND JURY INSTRUCTION IN PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT AT EIGHTH CIRCUIT COURT OF APPEALS IN ST. LOUIS	NS	4.80
02/12	/18 B		REVIEW APPELLANT'S REPLY BRIEF AND OUTLINE ISSUES FOR ORAL ARGUMENT AT EIGHTH CIRCUIT COURT OF APPEALS IN ST. LOUIS		1.30
02/13	/18 BI		REVIEW RECORD AND CASE CITATIONS IN APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT AT EIGHTH CIRCUIT COURT OF APPEALS		2.50
02/13	/18 G0		REVIEW AND EVALUATE HEARING TRANSCRIPTS IN PREPARATION TO DRAFT APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		.90
02/13	/18 G0		DRAFT ABSTRACT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		1.50
02/14	/18 GO		DRAFT STANDARD OF REVIEW SECTIONS OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL I PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	N	. 40
02/15	/18 GC		DRAFT INFORMATIONAL STATEMENT AND JURISDICTIONAL STATEMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL I PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	N	.70

ARKANSA	S STATE TREASURER	FILE	030470-000)1	PAGE
RE: DAVID S	INGER				
02/18/18 GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ENTIRE RECORD ON APPEA IN PREPARATION TO DRAFT STATEMENT OF THE C SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUT APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CAS	ASE ORY	2.10		
02/18/18 GCT	DRAFT STATEMENT OF THE CASE SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	1.20		
02/18/18 GCT	BEGIN DRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF		1.30		
02/19/18 GCT	CONTINUE DRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	1.30		
02/20/18 GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ARKANSAS CASES RE IMMUNITY OF STATE TREASURER AND DISMISSAL (CASES ON APPEAL DUE TO SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY : PREPARATION TO CONTINUE DRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTO APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN ORY	.40		
02/20/18 GCT	REVIEW AND EVALUATE ANDREWS DECISIONS AND RECENT COMMENTARY IN PREPARATION TO CONTINUDRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	UE	.90		
02/20/18 GCT	CONTINUE DRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL : PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	2.50		
02/21/18 GCT	FINISH DRAFTING ARGUMENT SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	3.70		
02/21/18 GCT	DRAFT TABLE OF CONTENTS AND TABLE OF AUTHORITIES SECTIONS OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF : INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	1.40		
02/21/18 GCT	DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE AND CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE SECTIONS OF APPELLANT'S BRIED IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	re F	.30		

	ARKANS	SAS STATE TREASURER	FILE	030470-0001	PAGE	4
RE:	DAVID	SINGER				
02/2	21/18 GC	T BEGIN PREPARING ADDENDUM SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	2.70		
02/2	22/18 GC	T FINISH PREPARING ADDENDUM SECTION OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	.80		
02/2	22/18 GC	T BEGIN REVISING COMPLETE DRAFT OF APPELLANT BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	'S	1.30		
02/2	3/18 BF	REVIEW DRAFT OF ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT BRI IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF PULASKI CIRCUIT COURT CASE	EF	1.00		
02/2	3/18 KG	EDIT APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CAS		1.30		
02/2	:3/18 GC	T FINISH REVISING COMPLETE DRAFT OF APPELLAN BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	T'S	1.10		
02/2	3/18 GC	T TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER DRAFT APPELLANT'S BRIEF AND ACTION ITEMS IN ADVANCE OF FILING	RE N	.10		
02/2	3/18 GC	T REVISE DRAFT OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF FOLLOWING REVIEW AND EDITS BY KATHY GRAVES IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	G	.40		
02/2	3/18 GC	T EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER RE DR. OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPELIN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	AFT AL	.10		
02/2	3/18 GC	T FINALIZE ADDENDUM AND ABSTRACT SECTIONS OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	IN	1.70		
02/2	6/18 LR	K PREPARE ELECTRONIC VERSION OF ADDENDUM AS REQUIRED BY THE COURT IN INTERLOCUTORY APP IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	EAL	1.20		
02/2	6/18 GC	T REVISE DRAFT OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF FOLLOWING COMMENTS AND EDITS FROM MR. T.J. FOWLER IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	G	1.30		

ARKAI	ISAS STATE TREASURER	FILE	030470-0001	PAGE	į
RE: DAVII	SINGER				
02/26/18 (GCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER F REVISIONS TO APPELLANT'S BRIEF AND ORAL ARGUMENT IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		.20		
02/26/18 (GCT BEGIN FINALIZING APPELLANT'S BRIEF WITH ADDENDUM CITATIONS, CASE CITATIONS, AND FIN REVISIONS IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASE COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		.90		
02/27/18 1	REVIEW REVISED ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL OF PULASKI CIRCUIT COURT CASE	7	.70		
02/27/18 (GCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER F REQUEST FOR ORAL ARGUMENT IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		.10		
02/27/18 (GCT CONTINUE FINALIZING APPELLANT'S BRIEF WITH ADDENDUM CITATIONS, CASE CITATIONS, AND FIN REVISIONS IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASE COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		.60		
02/28/18 I	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S BRIEF AND TRANSCRIPT OF JURY INSTRUCTIONS DISCUSSIONS AND ARGUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT IN EIGHTH CIRCUIT COURT OF APPEALS IN ST. LOUIS		2.80		
02/28/18 1	RK CITE CHECK APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTO APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		1.00		
02/28/18 (CCT EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH MR. T.J. FOWLER RE CONFIRMATION OF PLAN NOT TO REQUEST ORAL ARGUMENT IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	[.10		
02/28/18 (GCT FINISH FINALIZING APPELLANT'S BRIEF WITH ADDENDUM CITATIONS, CASE CITATIONS, AND FIN REVISIONS IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL IN PULASE COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE		3.40		
02/28/18 (CCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH KYLE BURTON AT ARKANSAS SUPREME COURT RE FORMAT OF APPELLANT'S BRIEF IN INTERLOCUTORY APPEAL I PULASKI COUNTY CIRCUIT COURT CASE	.N	.20		

ARKANSAS STATE TREASURER		FILE 030470-0001 P	AGE 6
RE: DAVID SINGER			
02/08/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS		0.10	
02/08/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	(NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10	
02/08/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	(NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10	
02/08/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS		0.50	
02/08/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	(NOT A DUPLICATE)	0.10	
02/26/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS		2.90	
02/26/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS		1.70	
02/27/18 DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS		4.10	
	mom		
	TOTAL COSTS:	9.60	
DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY:			
DIGITAL IMPRESSIONS	(96 items @ 0.10):	9.60	
mama a			
TOTAL:		9.60	